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2015 Women’s Success Symposium featuring
campus and community women boldly
discussion sexism, networking, and
negotiating in the workplace . (Top Right)

2014 Handprint Project acknowledged by the
National Women’s Studies Association as a
“Stand Out Program”. Individuals pledge to
take a stand against sexual assault. (Center
Right)

Take Back the Night has for 30 years annually
brought together 300 – 500 campus and
community members to speak out against
violence toward women and girls.

#FSDogsUnited a new and innovative project
which is increasing cross-cultural interaction
on our campus. The Diversity Dinner saw a
100% increase in participation from 30
attendees to 60 attendees. (Top Left)

National Coalition Building Institute Team –
Has provided our award winning “Prejudice
Reduction Workshop to over 7,000 members
of the campus and Community. (Center Left)

#BringBackOurGirls Rally 2014 “I didn't know
Fresno cared stated a member of the Igbo
Women’s Association as scores of Fresnans
came out in support. (Bottom Right)
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